
Summer Camp Fees and Important Information

Overview:
Saints Tabernacle Summer Camp is a fun, engaging youth camp for children ages 5 to
12 years old (campers that are 5 need to complete Kindergarten prior to enrolling in
camp).  Our camp hours are 7:00am-5:00pm Monday through Friday and our
experienced staff of teachers and administrators have over 30 years combined
experience in education and child care.

Camp Fees:
All campers are required to pay a $50.00 non-refundable annual registration fee. All
registered campers receive a camp T-shirt. Campers are required to wear their camp
T-shirt on trip days.

Our weekly camp fee is $125.00 per week and includes Breakfast and Lunch daily.

Payments:
All registered campers receive access to our payment portal, Procare.  All camp fees
and trip fees are invoiced weekly and can be paid online through Procare.

Discounts:
Saints Tabernacle offers a 10% sibling discount to all families and, $100 referral bonus!
Should you prefer to pay for camp in full, we offer a 10% discount at the time of
enrollment.  We accept all subsidies.

Enrichment:
Campers receive daily lessons in Math and Reading as well as S.T.E.M activities. For
information on the importance of completing reading and math activities during the
summer, click the Scholastic link included here! How to Prevent Your Kids from Losing
What They Learned in School During Summer Vacation.

What Does the Day Look Like?
Our camp doors open promptly at 7:00am and students are admitted from
7:00am-9:00am.  Campers can be conveniently signed in/out daily using our online

https://www.scholastic.com/parents/books-and-reading/raise-a-reader-blog/summer-slide.html
https://www.scholastic.com/parents/books-and-reading/raise-a-reader-blog/summer-slide.html


portal, Procare.  After 9am, the main camp doors are closed and students begin their
daily camp activities in their individual groups.  Although our camp groups are
organized by age, campers participate in large group activities, relay races,
competitions and team building events with the entire camp, 2-3 days per week.

Our camp is broken down into weekly themes which range from “Decades we Love” to
“Pirates in the Tabernacle!” Campers complete daily activities that reflect the theme of
the week.  Within the daily activities, campers have weekly movie trips, WOW activities,
dance instruction, and bi-weekly Friday trips.

Masks:
Masks are optional for camp this year however, if a camper is not feeling well, or
develops COVID like symptoms, please do not send them to camp.  Should a camper or
family member come in close contact with someone who has tested positive for
COVID-19, please do not send them to camp.  Please let us know immediately and, either
begin the quarantine process or schedule a COVID test prior to returning to camp.

Water Bottles:
Campers need a water bottle daily for camp.

Take a look at some of our pictures from previous camp years!

Nicole Williams,
Director


